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platforms are removed, will be discussed
at a workshop sponsored by the Minerals
Management Service, LSU's Center for
Energy Studies and LSU's Coastal
Marine Institute.

The workshop will be held at the
Doubletree Hotel in New Orleans. A
program and registration form are
enclosed.

CGR PTTC FORCED TO GO TO CD
ROM TO KEEP UP WITH OIL AND GAS
REGULATIONS

The CGR PTTC's popular program which
makes Louisiana Production and
Environmental Regulations available to

independent producers in computer
usable form is going to have to go from a
diskette format to a CD ROM format in
order keep up with revisions and
additions to regulations.  During the past
year the Louisiana Department of
Environmental Quality alone has
increased the supply of relevant
regulations by 100 pages. The new
package will, of course, require CD ROM
equipment, but users say it is a big
improvement over pen and paper. For
more information about this software
service contact Keith Long at 504/388-
4538.


